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Abstract: With the rapid development of
artificial intelligence technology, Text-to-
Video models, which represent the forefront
of current video generation technology, will
face numerous opportunities and challenges
in the future. This paper combines a large
number of research reports and scientific
experience to introduce the pros and cons of
Text-to-Video models for national security
work and put forward relevant suggestions.
Text-to-Video models have significant value
in protecting national security and
maintaining social unity. By generating
high-quality video content, Text-to-Video
models can effectively disseminate shared
social values, display the country's history,
culture, and social development
achievements, enhance national cultural soft
power and international discourse power,
and enhance the cohesion and influence of
protecting national security and
maintaining social unity. However, the
misuse of Text-to-Video model technology
and the spread of false information also
pose new challenges to protecting national
security and maintaining social unity.
Therefore, when using Text-to-Video
models, it is necessary to emphasize the
importance of their reasonable application
and ensure that technological applications
comply with laws regulations and social
ethics, and conform to shared social values
and serve the country's long-term
development and social harmony and
stability.
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1. Introduction
Text-to-Video models, particularly Sora,
represent the forefront of current video

generation technology. These models,
primarily based on deep learning frameworks
such as Generative Adversarial Networks
(GANs), Variational Autoencoders (VAEs),
and the recently emerged Diffusion Models,
have demonstrated the ability to generate high-
quality video content. Notably, Diffusion
Models have gained attention due to their
advantages in generating high-resolution, high-
quality images and videos [1]. A prominent
feature of the Sora model is its ability to
generate videos based on text descriptions. It
includes two Diffusion Models: a text-based
video generation model (T2V) and an image-
to-video generation model (I2V). The T2V
model synthesizes videos based on given text
inputs, while the I2V model adds image inputs
to generate videos that strictly adhere to the
content, structure, and style of the provided
reference image [1]. The development of these
technologies has not only driven technological
advancements in video generation but also
explored potential directions for future
applications.
Internationally, with the rapid development of
artificial intelligence technology, video
generation models, particularly text-based
video generation systems like Imagen Video,
have achieved high-definition video generation
capabilities. These systems generate high-
definition videos based on text prompts
through a combination of a base video
generation model and a series of interleaved
spatial and temporal video super-resolution
models. Imagen Video's success demonstrates
the high controllability of video generation
technology and its understanding of the world,
including the ability to generate diverse videos
and text animations in various artistic styles
and 3D object comprehension [2]. In certain
large countries, such as China, video
generation models have also gained
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widespread attention and application due to
technological advancements and market
demand. Chinese technology companies and
research institutions have made significant
progress in deep learning and video generation.
The domestic market demand for video content
continues to grow, especially in education,
entertainment, and advertising, providing
ample space for the application of Text-to-
Video models.
In the new era, the focus and application of
technological innovation in protecting national
security and maintaining social unity have
become particularly important, especially in
cutting-edge technology fields like Text-to-
Video models. The development of these
technologies has not only revolutionized
information dissemination but also provided
new perspectives and methods for protecting
national security and maintaining social unity.
The application of Text-to-Video models can
play a unique role in spreading common values
[3], enhancing national cultural soft power,
and strengthening international discourse
power. It also provides technical support for
high-quality economic development and
modern social governance. By generating
high-quality, highly realistic video content,
Text-to-Video models can provide a new
means of communication for the work of
protecting national security and maintaining
social unity. This technology can automatically
generate videos based on text descriptions,
allowing complex concepts and ideas to be
presented to the public in a more intuitive and
vivid way. This greatly improves the efficiency
and acceptance of information dissemination.
For instance, when promoting common social
values, Text-to-Video models can be used to
create video content with strong visual impact
and appeal, allowing these values to resonate
more deeply with the public.
Furthermore, Text-to-Video models
demonstrate immense potential in enhancing
national cultural soft power and international
discourse power. Through this technology,
high-quality videos showcasing a country's
traditional culture, historical heritage, and
modern development achievements can be
created and disseminated internationally. This
content can help people around the world gain
a more comprehensive and in-depth
understanding of the country. Not only does
this contribute to enhancing the country's

cultural influence internationally but also
builds bridges for international exchange and
cultural exchange.
The application of Text-to-Video models is
equally significant in achieving high-quality
economic development [4]. This technology
can be used to produce corporate promotional
videos [5], product demonstration videos, and
the like. It helps enterprises effectively
showcase their strengths and product features,
enhance brand image, and ultimately promote
economic development. Additionally, Text-to-
Video models can be applied in vocational
education and training. By generating videos
that simulate real-world operation scenarios,
they provide more intuitive and practical
learning materials for vocational skills training,
improving training effectiveness.
In terms of modernizing social governance,
Text-to-Video models offer an effective tool
for information dissemination and public
education. Governments and social
organizations can utilize this technology to
produce videos on public safety education,
health literacy, and legal awareness promotion
[6]. This allows them to convey important
information to the public in a more engaging
manner, raising public safety and legal
awareness, and promoting social harmony and
stability.
Therefore, as a cutting-edge technological
innovation, Text-to-Video models demonstrate
broad application prospects and far-reaching
influence in the new era's work of protecting
national security and maintaining social unity.
By deeply exploring and applying this
technology, significant achievements can be
made in spreading common values, enhancing
national cultural soft power, strengthening
international discourse power, promoting high-
quality economic development, and
modernizing social governance. This will
contribute to national development and the
progress of human society.

2. Opportunities and Challenges of Text-to-
Video Models

2.1 New Opportunities in Protecting
National Security and Maintaining Social
Unity.
In the context of the new era, Text-to-Video
models present novel opportunities for the
work of protecting national security and
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maintaining social unity, particularly in
disseminating shared social values and national
culture, and enhancing national cultural soft
power and international discourse power. The
application of these cutting-edge technologies
can not only facilitate effective information
dissemination but also deepen education on
shared social values, promote positive cultural
construction, and guide students and the public
towards positive values and ethical notions.
Text-to-Video models, through their high level
of innovation and interactivity, offer new
pathways for disseminating shared social
values and various cultures. These models can
automatically generate high-quality video
content based on text descriptions [7], allowing
complex concepts and ideas to be presented to
the public in a more intuitive and vivid manner.
For instance, by creating animated films or
short videos that delve into the essence of
social common values, not only can students'
and the public's understanding and recognition
of these values be enhanced but their sense of
national pride and mission can also be ignited.
Furthermore, utilizing Text-to-Video models to
showcase the rich historical and cultural
heritage, modern development achievements,
and the lifestyles of people from different
countries can effectively strengthen national
cultural confidence and promote the
inheritance and development of excellent
traditional cultures of various nations.
Text-to-Video models hold immense potential
for promoting social harmony, cultural
vibrancy, and global engagement. By
addressing the challenges and harnessing the
power of these technologies, we can
effectively disseminate shared values, promote
national cultures, strengthen international
discourse power, and guide students and the
public towards positive values and ethical
notions. As these models continue to evolve,
their contribution to a more harmonious,
culturally vibrant, and globally engaged
society will only grow.
However, the application of Text-to-Video
models also faces challenges [8]. Ensuring that
the generated video content accurately reflects
the shared social values and the true essence of
various cultures, avoiding misunderstandings
and deviations, is an issue that requires careful
consideration. Additionally, effectively
utilizing this technology to enhance national
cultural soft power and international discourse

power requires in-depth research and practical
exploration, taking into account the national
conditions and international situation of each
country.

2.2 Challenges Faced.
The potential social division and value
conflicts caused by technological abuse. As a
powerful content generation tool, the Text-to-
Video models can generate highly realistic
video content based on text descriptions. If
used to produce and disseminate false
information, it may mislead the public and
undermine the foundation of social trust,
exacerbating social conflicts and divisions. For
example, generating content with biased and
discriminatory characteristics may deepen the
divide between different groups and exacerbate
social conflicts, undermining social harmony
and stability [9]. In addition, technological
abuse may also lead to value conflicts. In the
context of globalization, the exchange of
different cultures and values is increasingly
frequent. If the Text-to-Video video model is
used to disseminate specific ideologies or
values while ignoring cultural diversity and the
inclusiveness of values, it may trigger value
conflicts and affect international relations and
social diversity and harmony.
The potential threat to social stability and
national image from the spread of false
information and harmful content [10]. Another
challenge we face with the Text-to-Video
models is the spread of false information and
harmful content, which poses a potential threat
to social stability and national image. Since the
generated video content is extremely realistic,
audiences with insufficient discernment skills
may have difficulty identifying its authenticity
and are thus susceptible to false information.
This not only misleads the public's
understanding of important social events, but
also may be used for political manipulation,
undermining election fairness, interfering with
the internal affairs of other countries, and
posing a threat to democratic systems and the
international order. Meanwhile, the spread of
harmful content, such as violence and
pornography, can have a negative impact on
teenagers and undermine social morals, affect
the country's image and cultural security.
Therefore, how to effectively regulate the use
of Text-to-Video models to prevent the spread
of false information and harmful content is a
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major challenge facing us today.

3. National Response Strategy
To address these challenges, it is necessary to
strengthen the research on technological ethics,
improve laws and regulations, establish sound
regulatory mechanisms, while enhancing
public media literacy education to enhance
society's ability to identify and prevent false
information. This will ensure the healthy
development of deepfake video models and
serve the modernization construction.

3.1 Strengthening Ideological and Political
Education.
In light of the challenges posed by Text-to-
Video models, particularly in terms of
technology misuse and the spread of
misinformation, strengthening ideological and
political education has emerged as a crucial
countermeasure. This necessitates not only
innovation in the content and form of
ideological and political education but also the
enhancement of ideological security in
cyberspace to ensure the effective
dissemination of shared social values and
social stability.
Leveraging Generative Text-to-Video models
to Innovate Ideological and Political Education
Content and Forms. Text-to-Video models, as
an advanced technological tool, hold immense
value for ideological and political education.
This technology enables the generation of
highly realistic and engaging video content on
demand, opening up new possibilities for
innovating ideological and political education
content and forms. For instance, Text-to-Video
models can be employed to create animations
or short films on topics such as world history,
culture, and shared social values [11]. These
materials can be used to convey ideological
and political education content to the public,
particularly the younger generation, in a more
vivid and intuitive manner. Such content is
more readily accepted and understood,
effectively enhancing the appeal and impact of
ideological and political education.
Furthermore, Text-to-Video models, can be
utilized to simulate social practice activities.
Through virtual reality technology, students
can immerse themselves in virtual
environments to experience social practices
[12], fostering their sense of social
responsibility and historical mission. This

innovative educational approach allows
students to learn and absorb shared social
values through interactive experiences, leading
to a deeper understanding and identification
with these values.
Strengthen ideological security in cyberspace.
With the development of information
technology, cyberspace has become a new
frontline in ideological struggle. The
emergence of Text-to-Video video models has
brought greater challenges to cyberspace
ideological security [13]. Therefore,
strengthening cyberspace ideological security
has become an important strategy to respond to
the Text-to-Video video challenge. This
requires starting from the following aspects:
Firstly, strengthen the supervision and
management of online content to prevent the
spread of false information and harmful
content. The government and relevant
departments should establish a sound online
content supervision mechanism and step up
efforts to combat false information and
harmful content to ensure a clear cyberspace
[14]. Secondly, enhance the public's, especially
young people's, online literacy and improve
their ability to identify false information. This
can be achieved through school education,
public media, etc. to popularize online literacy
education and educate the public on how to
distinguish the authenticity of online
information and how to properly handle
various information on the internet. Finally,
actively build a positive and healthy online
culture and promote the online dissemination
of social common values. By producing and
promoting high-quality content, the cyberspace
can be filled up and online public opinion can
be guided, thus creating a positive and upward-
looking online environment [15].

3.2 Strengthening Laws, Regulations, and
Technological Supervision.
In response to the challenges presented by
Text-to-Video models, strengthening laws,
regulations, and technological supervision is a
crucial strategy. This necessitates not only the
development of specific laws and regulations
tailored to Text-to-Video models, but also the
establishment of robust technological review
and content moderation mechanisms to prevent
technology misuse.
The rapid advancement of artificial
intelligence technologies like Text-to-Video
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models necessitates the development of
specific laws and regulations tailored to
address the emerging challenges and potential
risks associated with these novel technologies
[16]. Existing legal frameworks may struggle
to fully encompass the diverse issues arising
from these advancements, making the
formulation of specialized laws and regulations
for Text-to-Video models an urgent priority.
These regulations should clearly define the
legitimate scope of application for Text-to-
Video models, establishing fundamental
principles and standards for the creation and
dissemination of content generated using these
models. The objective is to ensure that
technological applications do not infringe upon
individual and collective rights or cause harm
to social order and the public interest. For
instance, the laws and regulations should
explicitly prohibit the use of Text-to-Video
models to create and distribute false
information, content that infringes on
copyright or portrait or any material that could
incite social panic, hatred, or violence [17].
Furthermore, for individuals and organizations
utilizing Text-to-Video models for content
creation and dissemination, the laws and
regulations should mandate the fulfillment of
corresponding information disclosure
obligations, ensuring that the public can
discern the source and authenticity of the
content.
Establish and improve technical review and
content supervision mechanisms. In addition to
strengthening laws and regulations,
implementing robust technological review and
content moderation mechanisms is another
critical measure to prevent the misuse of Text-
to-Video models technology. This
encompasses, but is not limited to, establishing
specialized technological review systems that
conduct both pre-release screening and post-
release supervision of content generated using
Text-to-Video models, ensuring that all
content adheres to legal requirements and
societal ethical norms. Technological review
mechanisms should leverage cutting-edge
information technologies [18], such as
artificial intelligence recognition techniques, to
perform automated content reviews, thereby
enhancing review efficiency and accuracy.
Additionally, public reporting and feedback
mechanisms should be established to
encourage public participation in content

moderation, fostering a favorable environment
for social co-governance. Moreover, stringent
accountability mechanisms, including but not
limited to economic penalties, industry bans,
and public apologies, should be implemented
for individuals and organizations that violate
laws, regulations, and review standards,
effectively deterring potential violators.

3.3 Strengthening Technological Support
for Safeguarding National Security and
Maintaining Social Unity.
In the face of the challenges posed by Text-to-
Video models, strengthening the technological
underpinnings of efforts to safeguard national
security and maintain social unity has emerged
as a crucial strategy. This encompasses not
only utilizing technological innovation to
promote unity and exchange among diverse
social groups but also employing Text-to-
Video models to enhance cultural connections
and emotional bonds with overseas
compatriots. The implementation of these
strategies aims to harness the power of
technology to reinforce the cohesion and
influence of protecting national security and
maintaining social unity, thereby contributing
to a harmonious and stable social environment.
Harnessing Technological Innovation to Foster
Unity and Exchange among Diverse Social
Groups. Technological innovation, particularly
the application of emerging technologies such
as Text-to-Video models, offers new avenues
for fostering unity and exchange among
diverse social groups [19]. Text-to-Video
models can generate highly realistic video
content that can be used to showcase the
cultural characteristics, lifestyles, and values of
different groups, thereby enhancing mutual
understanding and respect. For instance, Text-
to-Video models can be utilized to create a
series of short films introducing the cultures of
various nations and ethnicities, which can then
be disseminated widely through online
platforms, enabling more people to learn about
the rich tapestry of global cultures and
promoting ethnic unity. Moreover, Text-to-
Video models can also be employed to
simulate multiple perspectives on social hot-
button issues, helping different social groups to
comprehend each other's positions and
aspirations, thereby reducing
misunderstandings and conflicts. This
approach not only strengthens societal
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inclusivity and harmony but also ignites public
enthusiasm for participation in social
governance, fostering collective progress.
Leveraging Text-to-Video models to Enhance
Cultural Connections and Emotional Bonds
among Diverse Groups. Using China as an
example, Text-to-Video models offer a novel
approach to strengthening cultural ties and
emotional bonds with overseas Chinese and
compatriots in Hong Kong, Macao, and
Taiwan. By producing high-quality cultural
dissemination videos, the essence of traditional
Chinese festivals, significant social
development achievements, and the nation's
future development blueprint can be
effectively conveyed, enhancing their sense of
identity and belonging to their ancestral
homeland. For instance, Text-to-Video models
can be employed to create videos introducing
the customs of traditional festivals like
Chinese Spring Festival and Mid-Autumn
Festival, which can be shared with overseas
Chinese and compatriots in Hong Kong,
Macao, and Taiwan through internet platforms,
enabling them to experience the vibrant festive
atmosphere and patriotic sentiment even while
residing overseas. Additionally, videos
showcasing China's technological
advancements, cultural prosperity, and social
harmony can be produced to foster their
confidence and pride in China's development.
These measures will not only strengthen
cultural ties and emotional bonds with
overseas Chinese and compatriots in Hong
Kong, Macao, and Taiwan but also promote
their understanding and support for the nation's
development, contributing to the shared belief
of all Chinese people, both within and beyond
the country's borders, in safeguarding national
security, maintaining social unity, and
realizing the Chinese Dream.

3.4 Promoting International Cooperation
and Exchange.
In Response to the Challenges of Text-to-
Video models, Fostering International
Cooperation and Exchange Emerges as a
Crucial Strategy. As Text-to-Video models
continue to revolutionize the realm of content
creation and dissemination, the potential
challenges associated with this technology
have also come to the forefront. To effectively
address these concerns and ensure the
responsible development and application of

Text-to-Video models, fostering international
cooperation and exchange has emerged as a
critical strategy.
Actively Engaging in International Forums and
Organizations to Promote the Development of
International Rules and Standards. With the
rapid advancement of emerging technologies
like Text-to-Video models, the international
community urgently needs to establish a set of
consensus and rules to guide the development
and application of these technologies [20]. In
this process, actively participating in
international forums and organizations and
playing a constructive role is crucial for
promoting the development of international
rules and standards. This can not only help
form an international consensus on the
application of emerging technologies but also
promote the healthy development of
technologies and prevent the negative impacts
of technology misuse. For instance, initiatives
can be proposed in international organizations
such as UNESCO and the ITU, calling on the
international community to jointly focus on the
ethical and social implications of technologies
like Text-to-Video models and jointly explore
and formulate relevant international rules and
standards. Through these international
platforms, mutual understanding and trust can
be enhanced between countries, and
international rules and standards can be jointly
formulated that both promote technological
innovation and ensure that the application of
technology complies with ethical and legal
requirements.
Sharing Experiences with Other Countries to
Collectively Address the Challenges of
Technological Advancements. In the endeavor
to foster international cooperation and
exchange, sharing experiences with other
nations to jointly address the challenges posed
by technological advancements emerges as
another crucial strategy. By establishing
bilateral or multilateral cooperation
mechanisms, we can facilitate the exchange of
technological information and experiences,
enabling collective exploration of effective
strategies to mitigate the potential challenges
presented by emerging technologies like Text-
to-Video models.

4. Conclusion
Text-to-Video models, as an advanced
artificial intelligence technology, hold
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immense value in the realm of protecting
national security and maintaining social unity.
By generating high-quality, highly realistic
video content, Text-to-Video models can
effectively disseminate common social values,
showcase the history, culture, and social
development achievements of various
countries, and enhance national cultural soft
power and international discourse power. This
not only helps to enhance the public's sense of
identity and belonging to common social
values but also promotes communication and
understanding among different social groups
both domestically and internationally,
strengthening the cohesion and influence of
safeguarding national security and maintaining
social stability.
However, the misuse of Text-to-Video models
and the spread of misinformation also pose
new challenges to protecting national security
and maintaining social unity. Therefore, when
utilizing Text-to-Video models, it is crucial to
emphasize the importance of their rational
application, ensuring that the technology
application adheres to laws, regulations, and
social ethics, aligns with common social values,
and serves the country's long-term
development and social harmony and stability.
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